JAMAICA GAZETTE
SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS

Va. CXXXIV TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 1, 2011 No. 10

No. 11
THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT

THE NATIONAL MINIMUM WAGE (AMENDMENT) ORDER, 2011

In exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum Wage
Act. and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby made—

1. This Order may be cited as the National Minimum Wage (Amendment) Order, 2011.
and shal be read and construed as one with the National Minimum Wage Order, 1975
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Order) and al amendments thereto, and shall
come into operation on the 28th day of February, 2011.

2. Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended—

(& by deleting the words "11th day of May, 2009" and substituting therefor the
words "28th day of February, 2011";

(b) in sub-paragraph (a) by deleting the numerals "SI01.75™ and substituting
therefor the numerals"'$ 112.50";



24

©

(d)

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [FEB. 1,2011

in sub-paragraph (b) by deleting the numerals "$152.62" and substituting
therefor the numerals"'$ 168.75"; and

in sub-paragraph (c) by deleting the numerals "$203.50" and substituting
therefor the numerals " $225.00".

3. Paragraph 5 of the principal Order is amended—

@

(b)

(©

(d)

©

®

(¢))

(h)

0

0)

(k)

in sub-paragraph (1) by deleting the words " 11 th day of May, 2009" and
substituting therefor the words "28th day of February, 2011";

in sub-paragraph (1)(a), by deleting the numerals "$4,070.00" and "$152.62"
substituting therefor the numerals "$4,500.00" and "$ 168.75" respectively;

insub-paragraph(l)(b)bydeletingthenumerals"$4,171.75." and "$152.62"
and substituting therefor the numerals "$4,612.50" and "$168.75"
respectively;

in sub-paragraph (1)(c) by deleting the numerals"$4,273.50" and "$ 152.62"
and substituting therefor the numerals " $4,725.00" and "$ 168.75" respectively;

in sub-paragraph (1)(d) by deleting the numerals"$4,375.25" and "$ 152.62"and
substituting therefor the numerals " $4,837.50" and "$168.75" respectively;

in sub-paragraph (1)(e) by deleting the numerals " $4,477.00" and "$ 152.62"
and substituting therefor the numerals "$4,950.00" and "'$ 168.75" respectively;

in sub-paragraph (1 )(f) by deleting the numerals "$203.50" and substituting
therefor the numerals "$225.00"

in sub-paragraph (2) by deleting the words "$ 11th day of May, 2009" and
substituting therefor the words "28th day of February, 2011";

in sub-paragraph (2)(a) by deleting the numerals "$101.75" and substituting
therefor the numerals "$112.50";

in sub-paragraph (2)(b) by deleting the numerals "$ 152.62" and substituting
therefor the numerals"$168.75"; and

in sub-paragraph (2)(c) by deleting the numerals "$203.50" and substituting
therefor the numerals " $225.00".

Dated this 1 st day of February, 2011.

PEARNEL CHARLES
Minister of Labour and Social Security.

PRINTED BY JAMAICA PRINTING SERVICES (1992) LTD., (GOVERNMENT PRINTERS). DUKE STREET, KINGSTON. JAMAICA



JAMAICA GAZETTE
SUPPLEMENT

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS

VoL CXXXIV TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 1, 2011 No. 9

No. 10
THE MINIMUM WAGE ACT

Tin-: MINIMUM WAGE (INDUSTRIAL SECURITY GUARDS) (AMENDMENT)
ORDI:R, 2011

In exercise of the powers conferred upon the Minister by section 3 of the Minimum Wage
Act, and of every other power hereunto enabling, the following Order is hereby made—

1. This Order may be cited as the Minimum Wage (Industrial Security Guards)
(Amendment) Order, 2011 and shall be read and construed as one with the Minimum
Wage (Industrial Security Guards) Order, 1982 (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Order) and al amendments thereto, and shal come into operation on the 28th day of
February, 2011.

2. Paragraph 4 of the principal Order is amended—

(& by deleting the words "1st day of June, 2009" and substituting therefor the
words "'28th day of February, 2011";



(b)

©

()

PROCLAMATIONS, RULES AND REGULATIONS [FEB. 1,2011

in sub-paragraph (a), by deleting the numerals "$151.25" and substituting
therefor the numerals "$ 166.38";

in sub-paragraph (b) by deleting the numerals "$226.87" and substituting
therefor the numerals "$249.57"; and

in sub-paragraph (c) by deleting the numerals "$302.50" and substituting
therefor the numerals "$332.76".

3. Paragraph 6 of the principal Order is amended—

@

(b)

©

()

(©

by deleting the words "(1) With effect from the 1¢ day of June, 2009, and
subject to the provisions of sub-paragraph (2)" and substituting therefor the
words "With effect from the 28th day of February, 2011";

in sub-paragraph (@), as renumbered, by deleting the numerals "$27.50" and
substituting therefor the numerals "$30.25";

in sub-paragraph (b), as renumbered, by deleting the numerals "$30.25" and
substituting therefor the numerals "$33.28";

in sub-paragraph (c), as renumbered, by deleting the numerals " $20.35" and
substituting therefor the numerals "$22.39";

by deleting sub-paragraph (2).

4. Paragraph 8 (@) of the principal Order is amended by deleting the words "one
million five hundred thousand" and substituting therefor the words "two million".

Dated this 1¢ day of February, 2011.

FEARNEL CIARLTS
Minister of Labour and Social Security.

PRINTED BY JAMAICA PRINTING SERVICES (1992) LTD, (GOVERNMENT PRINTERS), DUKE STREET, KINGSTON. JAMAICA



